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The intricate landscape of Intellectual Property litigation (hereinafter referred to as the 
“IP litigation”) in India, particularly concerning the matters of jurisdiction in trademark 
and copyright infringement cases, has been significantly shaped by pivotal judgments 
from the Indian judiciary. These rulings, notably from the Supreme Court and the 
Bombay High Court, underscore the nuanced considerations that Intellectual Property 
Rights (hereinafter referred to as the “IP rights”) holders must navigate when initiating 
legal action. A recent judgment from the Karnataka High Court in the case Varun 
Chopra & Ors. v. Shyam Sundar Chopra & Ors., (RFA No. 1735 of 2023 (IPR), NC: 2024: 
KHC:12909) sheds significant light on the evolving complexities of jurisdictional 
nuances in the sphere of IP litigation in India. This analysis delves into the strategic 
legal implications of these judgments and their impact on the broader legal 
framework, offering insights into the evolving jurisprudence in this domain.



In the context of IP litigation, the question of jurisdiction is particularly complex due to 
the intangible nature of the assets involved and the widespread activities that can 
constitute infringement. The Indian legal system, through its statutes and judicial 
decisions, provides a framework for addressing these complexities, particularly in the 
statutes laid down in the Indian Trade Marks Act, 1999, the Copyright Act, 1957 and 
the litigation procedures laid down in the Civil Procedure Code�

The Supreme Court’s decision in the case of Sanjay Dalia marked a significant step in 
the clarification of jurisdictional issues in IP litigation. The core question before the 
court was whether a Plaintiff could file a lawsuit for trademark infringement in a 
jurisdiction where they have a subordinate office, even if the cause of action for the 
infringement did not occur in that jurisdiction. The court answered in negative, 
establishing a precedent that for jurisdictional purposes, the presence of a subordinate 
office does not grant the right to choose that location for filing the suit unless the 
cause of action arises there.



This decision directly addressed the potential for forum shopping, where Plaintiff’s 
might choose a jurisdiction perceived to be more favourable to their case, irrespective 
of its relevance to the dispute. By linking the jurisdiction to the place where the cause 
of action arises, the Supreme Court sought to ensure that lawsuits are filed in locations 
with a material connection to the dispute, thereby promoting fairness and efficiency in 
the legal process�

Following the Supreme Court’s ruling, the Bombay High Court in Manugraph India 
examined whether, in light of Sanjay Dalia, a Plaintiff’s right to file a suit for trademark 
and copyright violation in the jurisdiction of their principal or registered office was 
impacted when the cause of action did not arise in that jurisdiction. The court held 
that Plaintiff’s could still file suits in jurisdictions where their principal or registered 
offices are located, thereby affirming the rights of intellectual property holders to seek 
redress in their operational centres.



The Legal Framework and Jurisdictional Nuances



� Supreme Court’s Ruling in Sanjay Dalia



� Bombay High Court’s Interpretation in Manugraph India





This decision emphasises the importance of a principal place of business in 
determining jurisdiction, easing the logistical and financial burdens associated with 
litigation for IP rights holders. It reinforces the notion that while the cause of action is a 
crucial determinant of jurisdiction, the principal place of business also plays a 
significant role, particularly in facilitating access to justice for rights holders�

The Karnataka High Court's recent verdict in the case of Varun Chopra & Ors. v. Shyam 
Sundar Chopra & Ors., (RFA No. 1735 of 2023 (IPR), NC: 2024:KHC:12909) adds another 
layer of clarity to the jurisdictional debate, especially for corporations with multiple 
branches. In a comprehensive conclusion, the court's meticulous interpretation of 
Section 20(c) of the Code of Civil Procedure shed light on the nuanced aspects of 
jurisdiction in cases involving IP disputes. By highlighting that the jurisdiction to file a 
suit is not solely contingent on the defendant’s residence or place of business, the 
court underscored the significance of the cause of action in determining the 
appropriate legal forum. This clarification ensures that Plaintiff’s have the right to seek 
legal redress in a court where the infringement or violation occurred, irrespective of the 
geographical locations of the parties involved.



Moreover, the court’s ruling serves to uphold the fundamental principle of protecting 
IP rights and maintaining fairness in legal proceedings related to trademark 
infringement and passing off. By affirming the Plaintiff’s entitlement to pursue legal 
action based on the cause of action, the court has reinforced the importance of 
safeguarding IP rights and ensuring that legal remedies are accessible to those whose 
rights have been infringed upon. This landmark decision sets a crucial precedent for 
future cases grappling with similar jurisdictional complexities, providing a clear and 
definitive framework for parties navigating intellectual property disputes and seeking 
equitable resolutions through the legal system.



The court reached its verdict by carefully interpreting the provisions of Section 20 of 
the Code of Civil Procedure. It deduced that under clauses (a) and (b) of Section 20, the 
court’s jurisdiction is tied to the defendant's residence, place of business, or work at the 
time of the suit's initiation. In contrast, clause (c) of Section 20 focuses solely on the 
cause of action, irrespective of the defendant's location. The court emphasized that for 
suits falling under Section 134 of the Act of 1999, the Plaintiff can also file a suit where 
they reside, carry on business, or work for gain. This legal reasoning allowed the court 
to clarify the requirements for filing suits under different sections and uphold the 
Plaintiff’s right to choose the forum based on the specific provisions of the law. 
However, under clause (b) of Section 20 of the Code, the Plaintiff need the Court's 
permission to file the suit where any defendant resides. For both clauses (a) and (b), 
establishing the cause of action is not necessary to confer territorial jurisdiction; only 
the defendant's residence, place of business, or work matters. The clauses (a) to (c) of 
Section 20 are independent, and if clause (c) is considered alone, the Court's 
jurisdiction is solely based on the cause of action, making the defendant's residence or 
business location irrelevant. 



Importantly, the said judgment does not dilute Section 20(c) of the Code. The choices 
available under clauses (a), (b), and (c) of Section 20 of the Code are still available to the 
Plaintiff and not taken away under Section 134 of the Act of 1999. These sections are 
not contradictory but complementary, as they both aim to facilitate the fair and 
efficient resolution of trademark infringement disputes. By aligning the principles of 
Section 20 with the specific provisions of Section 134, the legal system can effectively 
address trademark-related issues while upholding the fundamental tenets of 
jurisdiction and intellectual property protection.



The juxtaposition of these cases illustrates the Indian judiciary’s approach to balancing 
the rights of IP rights holders with considerations of fair and convenient legal process. 

� The Karnataka High Court’s Recent Verdict



Implications for Legal Practitioners and Rights 
Holders
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Sanjay Dalia puts a check on potential forum shopping by emphasising the relevance 
of the cause of action to the chosen jurisdiction. Additionally, Manugraph India 
reassures rights holders that they can seek redress in their operational epicentre, 
provided it is the location of their principal office, thus not stripping them of the 
convenience and strategic advantage of litigating in their primary jurisdiction. 



The latest verdict by the Karnataka High Court in Varun Chopra case further highlights 
the importance of understanding the nuances of jurisdiction under Sections 20 of the 
Civil Procedure Code and 134 Trademarks Act, especially in cases involving 
corporations with multiple branches. The judgment provides clarity on the 
interpretation of these sections, emphasising that the cause of action determines 
jurisdiction under Section 134, even if the defendant’s presence is not in the same 
location.



Furthermore, these rulings provide a roadmap for navigating the jurisdictional 
challenges inherent in IP litigation. By emphasizing the material connection between 
the cause of action and the chosen jurisdiction, and acknowledging the significance of 
the principal place of business, the judiciary has struck a balance between deterring 
forum shopping and ensuring access to justice for rights holders.



The strategic implications of these judgments for IP litigation cannot be overstated. 
Rights holders must carefully assess where to initiate legal action, taking into 
consideration the nuances of jurisdictional requirements as clarified by these landmark 
decisions. This involves a thorough analysis of where the infringement occurred, the 
location of the defendant, and the rights holder's principal place of business.



Moreover, these decisions shed light on the judiciary’s commitment to protecting IP 
rights while ensuring a fair and efficient legal process. Legal practitioners must, 
therefore, stay abreast of the evolving jurisprudence in this area, advising their clients 
accordingly to navigate the complexities of jurisdictional issues in IP litigation.



The Indian judiciary’s meticulous approach to jurisdiction in IP litigation, as exemplified 
by the decisions in the Sanjay Dalia and Manugraph India cases, along with the recent 
verdict from the Karnataka High Court, demonstrates a sophisticated balance between 
the protection of IP rights and the practicalities of legal processes. These rulings 
collectively contribute to a legal environment where the strategic selection of 
jurisdiction is informed by both the locus of the cause of action and the operational 
epicentres of the rights holders. This jurisprudential evolution emphasises the 
judiciary’s recognition of the complexities inherent in intellectual property disputes, 
especially in an era where digital technologies and global business operations can blur 
geographical boundaries. By anchoring jurisdiction in both the cause of action and the 
principal place of business, the courts have provided a clear framework for rights 
holders to initiate actions in jurisdictions that are not only legally appropriate but also 
logistically and financially feasible.



In conclusion, the Indian judiciary’s nuanced approach to jurisdictional issues in IP 
litigation illuminates the path forward for rights holders and legal practitioners alike. 
These decisions serve as a beacon, guiding stakeholders through the complexities of 
the legal system while ensuring that the protection of intellectual property remains a 
paramount concern. As the digital age continues to challenge traditional notions of 
geography and jurisdiction, the clarity provided by these judgments is both welcome 
and necessary, offering a solid foundation for future cases and contributing to the 
robustness of IP laws in India.

Strategic Legal Considerations



Conclusion
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